
Vendor Name

DESCRIPTION ITEM #

Price Per 
EACH (If 
item sold 
by each)

  
BOX / 

Quantity (ie 
5.00  

100/bx)

  
CASE / 

Quantity  (ie 
50.00  5 
bx/cs) ITEM #

Price Per 
EACH (If 
item sold 
by each)

  
BOX / 

Quantity 
(ie 5.00  
100/bx)

  
CASE / 

Quantity  
(ie 50.00  5 

bx/cs) ITEM #

Price Per 
EACH (If 
item sold 
by each)

Price Per 
BOX / 

Quantity (ie 
5.00  100/bx)

Price Per CASE / 
Quantity  (ie 

50.00  5 bx/cs) ITEM #

Price Per 
EACH (If 
item sold 
by each)

  
BOX / 

Quantity (ie 
5.00  

100/bx)

Price Per 
CASE / 

Quantity  (ie 
50.00  5 bx/cs)

1 2" N/S STRETCH CONFORMING GAUZE 752215  0.79 200/pk
EFA-1000

0.74
12

NON25492 0.40 1.77   12/BX 7.08  96/CS JML205 9.00  96/cs

2 3" N/S STRETCH CONFORMING GAUZE 752221 1.49 200/pk
EFA-1001

0.79
12

NON25493 0.43 2.21  12/BX 8.76  96/CS JML305 9.50  96/cs

3 4" N/S STRETCH CONFORMING GAUZE 752227 2.23 200/pk  
EFA-1002

1.05
12

NON25494 0.49 2.34  12/BX 10.36  96/CS JML405 12.50  96/cs

4 4" x 10" UNNA BOOT BANDAGE 141011 3.84
no bid

NONUNNAS140 9.00 N/A 80.00  12/CS

5 2 1/4" WAFER (CONVATEC) - NON-FLEXIBLE 4X4 315721 44.35 10/bx
no bid

SQ401575 30.00  10/bx

6 2 1/4" DRAINABLE POUCH W/LOCK N ROLL (HOLLISTER) 359190 21.48 10/bx
no bid

7
2 1/4" TWO-PIECE CUT TO FIT SKIN BARRIER 
(HOLLISTER) 740704 26.42 5/bx

no bid
 

8 ACE BANDAGES 4" - PLEASE PROVIDE SAMPLE 423111 5.34 10/bx
efa-1072

3.85
10

DYNJ05131 1.87 N/A 32.86  20/CS

9
ADHESIVE TAPE REMOVER PADS - PDI # 816400 - If equal 
item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 113916 3.44 100/bx

EFA-4164
3.25

100
MDS090855 0.37 3.43  100/bx 16.04 1000/cs

10 ATRAC-TAIN CREAM, 2 OZ 203919 6.98
no bid

11 ALCOHOL ISOPROPYL BOTTLES NB NB NB NB
EFA-4099

1.20
1

CM115 18.00  12/cs

12 ALCOHOL PREP PAD, MEDIUM 2 PLY 752068 1.25 200/bx
EFA-4149

0.85
100

MDS090735 .37 (LARGE 1.64  200/BX 22.70  2000/CS

13 AMD 4 x 4 FENESTRATED DRAIN SPONGE 185315 2.39 25x2/bx
no bid

PRM256000H 0.44 2.60  50/BX 27.82  600/CS JML9210 16.00  600/cs

14 APRONS DISPOSABLE BIB STYLE 776332 34.94 300/ca
EIC-5117

4.29
100

N/A

15
AQUACEL ROPE 3/4" x 18" - # 177904 - If  equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 164554 55.84 5/bx

no bid

MSC7818R 5.00 27.36  5/BX  M  253.58  50/CS SQ177904 31.00  5/bx

16
AQUACEL AG ROPE 3/4" x 18" - # 403771 - If  equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 150491 97.28 5/bx

no bid

MSC9818R 58.91  5/BX  M  579.07  50/CS SQ403771 72.00  10/bx

17 AQUACEL EXTRA SHEET, 4X5 202159 4.72 47.24 10/bx

no bid

SQU420674 60.00   10/BX SQ420674 50.00  10/bx

18 ASPIRA DRESSING KIT - PROVIDE SAMPLE 205428 144.44 5/ca
no bid

19 ASPIRA DRAINGE KIT - PROVIDE SAMPLE 190316 352.44 5/ca
no bid

20 AUTOLOCK 1.75 OSTOMY POUCH 806539 24.60 10/bx
no bid

SQU401502 23.80  10/BX

21 AUTOLOCK 1.75 OSTOMY WAFER 806414 45.85 10/bx
no bid

22 AUTOLOCK 2.25 OSTOMY POUCH 708340 24.60 10/bx
no bid

23 AUTOLOCK 2.25 OSTOMY WAFER 806422 45.85 10/bx
no bid

24 AUTOLOCK 2.75 OSTOMY POUCH 708355 24.60 10/bx
no bid

24 AUTOLOCK 2.75 OSTOMY WAFER 806430 45.85 10/bx
no bid

26
Bandages, sheer, juniors, latex free, 3/8” x 1 ½ “  by Dynarex  
item # 3608 750028 0.98 100/bx

EFA-1107
0.97

100
NON25509 2.14  100/BX 27.16  3600EA/CS DY3608 1.25  100/bx

27 BANDAIDS - FABRIC - 3/4" x 3" 252584 1.15 100/bx
EFA-1106

1.81
100

NON25650 0.36 2.42  100/BX 16.74  1200EA/CS DY3612 2.30  100/bx

28 BARD DRAINAGE BAGS - 2000mL, ANTI-REFLUX 172420 1.24 24.71 20/ca
no bid

DYNC1674 1.99 25.29  20/CS BA802001 34.80  20/cs

29 BETADINE SOLUTION - 4 OZ 263223 1.45
EFA-
415701 1.09

1

30
BIATIN 4" x 4" FOAM DRESSING, STERILE, NON-
ADHESIVE - PROVIDE SAMPLE 137947 38.75 10/ca

no bid

31 BIATIN ALGINATE AG - 4" x 4" - PROVIDE SAMPLE 162351 4.08 40.82 10/bx
no bid

MSC9445EP 11.00 97.30  10/BX 381.19  50/CS

32 BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF - CHILD 136055 18.93
EDI-
730002 5.21

1
MDS9387LF 22.39

33 BLUNT PLASTIC CANNULAS 117675 20.80 100/bx
EDI-
326310 13.75

100
HCS4514 16.62  50/CS

34 BORDER GAUZE 4" X 10" STERILE 156301 22.06 15/bx
no bid

MSC32410 1.63 22.57  15/BX 189.92  150/CS

35 BORDER GAUZE 4" X 5" STERILE 151783 15.65 15/bx
no bid

MSC3245 0.89 11.50  15/BX 104.79  150/CS DY3493
5.50  25/bx  
4x4

36 BORDER GAUZE 6" X 6" STERILE 852426 17.43 15/bx
no bid

MSC3266 1.22 16.60  15/BX 149.10  150/CS DY3494 8.00  25/bx

37
BRAUN NO TOUCH & FOREHEAD THERMOMETER 
(COMES WITH BATTERIES) 753460 134.87

EDI-7451
37.44

1
MDSNOTOUCH 55.00

38
BRAVA ELASTIC BARRIER STRIP - Coloplast - PROVIDE 
SAMPLE 203788 23.18 20/bx

no bid
COI120700 N/A 25.00  20/BOX N/A

39 BUTTERFLY 21G 3/4" 12" COLLECTION SET 113894 66.18 50/bx
EDI-
301101 12.80

50

40 BUTTERFLY 23G 3/4" 12" COLLECTION SET 163154 66.18 50/bx
EDI-
301301 12.80

50
BD367283 54.00  50/bx

41 BZK ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES 196811 3.23 100/bx
EFA-4155

1.60
100

MDS094184 N/A 2.50  100/BX 21.00 1000/CS DY1303 19.50  1000/cs

 Concordance Quad Med Medline JML Medical



42 CASTILE SOAP TOWLETEES 5" x 9" 709606 2.87 100/bx
no bid

43 ChlorPrep 3mL Applicator 921387 36.77 25x3/bx
EFA-
416305 20.77

100
MDF260400 N/A 48.19  25/BX 183.11  100/CS

44 CHUX 17" x 24" 749587 20.56 300/ca
EFA-5320

21.02
200

MSC281224 31.89  300/CS

45 Clipper, Nail, Toe, No-File, Large 254502 3.47 6/bx
no bid

MDSR004211 2.91 DY4893 4.80  12/bx

46
CLOSED POUCH W/FILTER 2" - Hollister - PROVIDE 
SAMPLE 158617 41.18 30/bx

no bid
HTP18323 50.00  30/BOX

47 COBAN, SELF-ADHERENT BANDAGE, 3" x 5YDS, TAN 962019 1.67 40.11 24/ca
EFA-
107803 23.60

24
3173 25.00  24/cs

48 COBAN, SELF-ADHERENT BANDAGE, 4" x 5YDS, TAN 555433 2.09 37.60 18/ca
EFA-
107804 21.05

18
3174 25.00  18/cs

49 COHESIVE SEALS - EAKIN # 839002 or equal 101638 4.32 86.31 20/bx
no bid

SQU839002 85.94  20/BOX

50
Coloplast Speedicath Plus Compact Female Intermittent 
Catheter, Straight, Sterile, 14 FR, 3.5" 611022 41.64 30/bx

no bid

51 COMBINE PADS 5" x 9", STERILE 237196 1.60 20/bx 31.99 400/ca
EFA-1060

1.87
20

NON21450 0.44 3.75  25/BOX 60.00  400/CS JML7059 31.00  400/cs

52 CONDOM CATHETERS 136219 1.32 131.82 100/bx
no bid

MNT5100 140.00 100/BOX

53
CONVEX SKIN BARRIER STRIP, 2 1/4" WAFER - Hollister - 
PROVIDE SAMPLE 235505 38.02 5/bx

no bid
HTP11403 11.00 50.00  5/BOX

54 CPR FACE SHIELDS 239100 1.06 105.88 100/ca
EAW-
2753 1.08

1

55 DENTAL BIBS 600567 19.39 500/ca
no bid

56 DENTIPS, ORAL SWAB 113271 171.18 100/ca
no bid

57 DIGITAL ORAL THERMOMETER 747715 3.35
EDI-7449

1.91
1

5610 2.00

58 DIGITAL ORAL THERMOMETER SHEATHS 747703 3.88
EDI-7450

2.59
100

5614 2.50  100/bx

59 36" DISPOSABLE INFANT TAPE MEASURE 642171 2.03 10/pk 20.34 10/ca
no bid

NON171333 0.56

60
DISPOSABLE BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF & 
SPHYGMOMANOMETER KIT 271621 5.88 58.83 10/ca

EDI-7324-
BL 88.02

1

61 DOOR PULLEY EXERCISE SET NB NB NB NB
no bid

MDSP501010 16.51

62 DUO DERM CGF 4" x 4" HYDROCOLLOID DRESSINGS 206937 11.18 5/bx
no bid

MSC5544 39.04  10/BX 187660 22.00  5/bx

63 DUO DERM X-THIN 4" x 4" HYDROCOLLOID DRESSINGS 135988 14.82 10/bx
no bid

MSC5100 26.43  10/BX 187955 25.00  10/bx

64 EAR LOOP FACE MASK 200549 2.55 50/bx
EIC-5154

3.11
50

NON27120H 4.00  50/BX 2210 2.00  50/bx

65 EMERY BOARD, 4.25" 117365 1.82 144/bx
no bid

NON801778 6.28  144/BOX

66
ENDOFORM DERMAL TEMPLATE 2" X 2", OVINE 
COLLAGEN ECM, LATEX-FREE 206183 130.12 10/bx

no bid
MSC8622EP 7.77  MEDL  74.07  10/BX 317.31  50/CS

67 ENEMA KIT, 1500cc, BAG/TUBE 595959 1.76 88.19 50/ca
no bid

DYND70100 1.79 N/A 54.23  48/CS

68 14FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 750532 2.34 23.43 10/bx
no bid

DYND11501 5075 24.00  10/bx

69 14FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE NB NB NB NB
no bid

N/A 5083 24.00  10/bx

70 16FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 750535 23.43 10/bx
no bid

DYND11502 35.00  10/cs 5076 24.00  10/bx

71 16FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 750541 23.43 10/bx
no bid

DYND11532 35.00  10/cs 5084 24.00  10/bx

72 18FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 750538 23.43 10/bx
no bid

DYND11503 35.00  10/cs 5077 24.00  10/bx

73 18FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 248104 76.44 10/ct
no bid

DYND11533 35.00  10/cs 5085 24.00  10/bx

74 20FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 260366 23.43 10/bx
no bid

DYND11504 35.00  10/cs 5078 24.00  10/bx

75 20FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 262576 76.44 10/bx
no bid

DYND11534 35.00  10/cs 5086 24.00  10/bx

76 22FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER  - ALL SILICONE 260367 23.43 10/bx
no bid

DYND11505 35.00  10/cs 5079 24.00  10/bx

77 22FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 263491 76.44 10/ct
no bid

DYND11535 35.00  10/cs 5087 24.00  10/bx

78 24FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 260368 23.43 10/bx
no bid

DYND11506 35.00  10/cs 5080 24.00  10/bx

79 24FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - ALL SILICONE 277319 76.44 10/ct
no bid

DYND11536 35.00  10/cs 5088 24.00  10/bx

80 14FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 182859 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11754 9.00  12/cs

81 14FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 182868 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11774 9.00  12/cs

82 14FR SELF-CATH COUDE TAPERED TIP W/GUIDE MALE 301153 60.00 30/bx
no bid

URO3PVC1416C 35.00  30/cs

83 16FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 181371 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11756 9.00  12/cs

84 16FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 181384 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11776 9.00  12/cs

85 18FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER- SILICONE COATED 181372 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11758 9.00  12/cs



86 18FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 181364 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11778 9.00  12/cs

87
18FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 2 WAY 
LATEX COUDE TIP 192633 7.88 10/bx

no bid
DYND11218 41.00  12/cs

88
18FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 2 
WAY LATEX COUDE TIP 842880 7.88 10/bx

no bid
N/A N/A

89 20FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 182860 7.65 10/bx
no bid

DYND11760 9.00  12/cs

90 20FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 181366 7.65 10/bx
no bid

DYND11780 9.00  12/cs

91
20FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED - 
COUDE 196485 7.66 10/bx

no bid
N/A N/A

92 22FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 181373 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11762 9.00  12/cs

93 22FR 30CC FOLEY CATHERTER - SILICONE COATED 181367 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11782 9.00  12/cs

94 24FR 5CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 182862 7.65 10/bx
no bid

DYND11764 9.00  12/cs

95 24FR 30CC FOLEY CATHETER - SILICONE COATED 182869 7.66 10/bx
no bid

DYND11784 9.00  12/cs

96 FOLEY 14FR MALE STRAIGHT CATH 750496 13.53 50/bx
no bid

DYND10723 13.00  30/cs

97 FOLEY 14FR FEMALE STRAIGHT CATH 750511 13.53 50/bx
no bid

DYND10703 13.00 30/cs

98 COUDE FOLEY CATHETER 16FR 5CC - ALL SILICONE 269510 171.92 10/bx
no bid

DYND11592 108.00  10/cs

99 COUDE FOLEY CATHETER 18FR 5CC - ALL SILICONE 986521 170.25 10/bx
no bid

DYND11593 108.00  10/cs

100 COUDE FOLEY CATHETER 20FR 5CC - ALL SILICONE 277666 177.78 10/bx
no bid

DYND11594 108.00  10/cs

101 FOLEY CATHETER TRAY 30CC 153191 1.15 22.95 20/ca
no bid

DYNC1815 34.00  20/cs 4927 32.00  20/cs

102 FOLEY INSERTION TRAY, 10CC W/O FOLEY 179888 1.33 26.59 20/ca
no bid

DYNC1810 26.00  20/cs 4926 31.50  20/cs

103 FOLEY HOLDER VELCRO - PROVIDE SAMPLE 790942 25.29 10/bx
no bid

DYND16900 30.00  10/cs

104
FOLEY SECURE DEVICE ANCHOR PAD STYLE (STAT-
LOCK) 105463 102.94 25/bx

no bid
SAFESECURE 167.00  50/cs BAFOL0102 102.00  25/bx

105 FOLEY URINARY EXTEN/CONN TUBE 374280 15.59 50/ca
EIC-
960015 1.94

1
DYND12550 41.00  50/cs AS311 17.00  50/cs

106 FOLEY CATHETER DRAINAGE BAG W/TUBING 610212 5.48 109.65 20/ca
no bid

URO53211 56.00  50/cs 4271 24.00  20/cs

107 FACE MASK WITH EYE SPLASH PROTECTION 709507 29.41 25/bx
EIC-5150

17.09
50

108 FINGER TIP PULSE OXIMETER 750700 31.29
EDI-
700000 17.40

1
HCSM70 46.97 7088 21.00

109 GEL, SHAMPOO/BODYWASH, REMDY PHYTO, 4 OZ NB NB NB NB
no bid

MSC092004 1.91 60.48  48/CS

110 GLOVES - P/F LARGE VINYL  752086 2.19 100/bx 21.90 10bx/ca
no bid

JML1613 2.50  100/bx

111 GLOVES - P/F MEDIUM VINYL 752092 2.19 100/bx 21.90 10bx/ca
no bid

JML1612 2.50  100/bx

112 GLOVES - P/F SMALL VINYL 752098 2.19 100/bx 21.90 10bx/ca
no bid

JML1611 2.50  100/bx

113
GLOVES - EXAM - P/F LARGE VINYL - ProCure # PC510 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample Required 752086 2.19 100/bx 21.90 10bx/ca

no bid

114
GLOVES - EXAM - P/F MEDIUM VINYL  - ProCure # PC510 
or equal - If quoting equal item, Sample Required 752092 2.19 100/bx 21.90 10bx/ca

no bid

115
GLOVES - EXAM - P/F SMALL VINYL  - ProCure # PC510 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample Required 752098 2.19 100/bx 21.90 10bx/ca

no bid

116

GLOVES - SYNTHETIC - EXAM - P/F LARGE VINYL - 
McKesson # 11111300 - If quoting equal item, Sample 
Required 752104 2.19 100/bx 21.90 10bx/ca

no bid

117

GLOVES - SYNTHETIC - EXAM - P/F MEDIUM VINYL  - 
McKesson # 11111300  - If quoting equal item, Sample 
Required 752107 3.52 100/bx 35.22 10bx/ca

no bid

118

GLOVES - SYNTHETIC - EXAM - P/F SMALL VINYL  - 
McKesson # 11111300  - If quoting equal item, Sample 
Required 752110 3.52 100/bx 35.22 10bx/ca

no bid

119
Handheld Aneroid Sphygmomanometer (for Clinicians, not 
disposable) 254970 23.94

EDI-
730400 58.63

1
MDS9380LF  AD  28.29

120 HIBICLENS LIQUID 4 OZ 266049 4.39 210.64 48/ca
no bid

121 HEMOCUE HB 201 MICROCUVETTES 139641 64.12
no bid

HMQ111716 295.17  200/CS

122 Hollister Drainable pouch with filter 1 3/4 109012 25.53 10/bx
no bid

123 Hollister New Image skin barrier 1 3/4 - 1 1/4 pre-sized 312707 26.42 5/bx
no bid

124 HOSPITAL DISPATCH WIPES (WITH BLEACH) 995654 12.73 150/bx101.84 8bx/ca
EIC-
411300 8.08

1 tub
MSC351400AN  150WIPES/CAN 79.69  8TUBS/CS

125

HYDROFERA BLUE READY FOAM DRESSING - Hollister # 
HBRS4520 - If quoting equal item, Sample & 
Specifications REQUIRED 214833 8.41 84.10 10/bx

no bid

HTPHBRT4520

126

HYDROFERA BLUE READY TRANSFER   4" x 5 " - Hollister 
# HBRT4050 - If quoting equal item, Sample & 
Specifications Required 253080 8.41 84.10 10/bx

#N/A

HTPHBRT4050

127
IRRIGATION TRAY WITH PISTON SYRINGE - # AS136 - if 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 108979 0.798 15.96 20/ca

AS136
0.97

1
DYND20302  MEDLINE BRANDED 18.00  20/CS AS136 18.00  20/cs



128 ISOLATION GOWNS YELLOW 154212 12.87 50/ca
EIC-5101

15.20
50

CRI4000 16.12  50/CS

129 LEG BAG MEDIUM URINARY 600 ML 371229 0.524 25.14 48/ca
no bid

DYND12574 1.29 37.12  48/CS 4281 28.50  48/cs

130 N/S 2 x 2, 8 PLY GAUZE SPONGES 752218 0.67 200/pk 16.77 25/ca
EFA-1017

0.90
200

PRM21208C .84  200/BAG 34.20  5000/CS JML228 20.00  5000/cs

131 2" STERILE KLING 234794 2.34 12/bx 18.70 8/ca
EFA-1004

1.46
12

PRM25496 2.12  12/BX JML206 20.00  96/cs

132 3" STERILE KLING 204406 2.74 12/bx 21.89 8/ca
EFA-1005

1.74
12

PRM25497 2.24  12/BX JML306 18.00  96/cs

133 4" STERILE KLING 181343 2.91 12/bx 23.30 8/ca
EFA-1006

1.61
12

PRM25498 2.73  12/BX JML406 20.00  96/cs

134 6" NON-STERILE KLING 749836 11.18 48/ca
EFA-1007

1.91
6

PRM25499 17.42  48/CS JML605 15.00  48/cs

135 3"x3" STERILE NONADH ADAPT 176766 4.96 100/bx 59.58 12/ca
3434

6.34
100

CUR250330 0.77 21.04  50/BX 205.68  600/CS

136 3"x8" STERILE NONADH ADAPT 643059 6.67 50/bx 80.00 12/ca
EFA-1048

8.09
50

CUR250381 1.54 28.30  24/BX 115.85  144/CS 3039 21.00  50/bx

137
Kendall KenGuard Irrigation Syringe Bulb Syringe with 
Protector Cap 437699 24.26 20/ca

EDI-
340141 1.35

1
AS130 19.50  20/cs

138 LATEX FREE TOURNQUET - PROVIDE SAMPLE 749842 0.097 24.12 250/bx241.18 10bx/ca
EFA-
350110 0.87 pk/10 TRILFTK420 19.17  25/BX

139
LEADCARE II TEST KIT - # 70-6762 - If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 170509 350.06 48/bx

no bid

M-B706762 350.00  48/BX

140 MAGELLAN SAFETY NEEDLES - 25G x 1 1/2" 168818 11.86 50/bx 118.60 10/ca
EDI-
339215 11.74 50 SYRS100257    MEDLINE BR 21.40  100/BX 135.20  800/CS

141 MAGELLAN SAFETY NEEDLES - 25G x 5/8" 159837 12.15 50/bx 121.50 10/bx
EDI-
339213 11.74 50 SYRS100253   MEDLINE BRA21.40  100/BX 134  800/CS

142
MEDIHONEY WOUND & BURN DRESSING - # 31045 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 142327 11.09

no bid
31045 11.00

143
MEDIHONEY GEL - # 31805 - If quoting equal item, Sample 
& Specification REQUIRED 196548 49.86 10/bx 199.50 4bx/ca

no bid
MNK0005  MEDL  4.71 35.00  10/BX N/A 31805 48.00  10/bx

144
4"x4" MELGISORB  - # 251100 - If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 209548 31.25 10/bx 312.50 10bx/ca

no bid

145
4"x4" MELGISORB AG - # 255100 -  If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specifications Required 139337 79.55 10/bx 795.55 10bx/ca

no bid

146
7.2" x 7.2" MEPILEX BORDER SACRUM - # 282000 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 138063 48.69 5/bx 389.55 8bx/ca

no bid

147
 9" x 9" MEPILEX BORDER SACRUM - # 282400 - If quoting 
equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 138704 76.48 5/bx 382.39 5bx/ca

no bid

148
5" x 8" MEPILEX HEEL FOAM DRESSING  - # 288100 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 113403 56.82 5/bx 284.09 5bx/ca

no bid
MSC1200EP 8.35 38.02 307.74

149
6" x 8" MEPILEX TRANSFER  - # 294899 - If quoting equal 
item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 159051 47.82 bx 382.55 8bx/ca

no bid
MSC1747EP 6.55 58.93 280.23

150
2" MEFIX SELF-ADHESIVE FABRIC TAPE  - # 310599 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 160484 4.74 189.55 40/ca

no bid
MSC4002 5.20 3542 2.50

151
4" MEFIX SELF-ADHESIVE FABRIC TAPE  - # 311099 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 161402 8.78 175.68 20/ca

no bid
MSC4004 10.40 3544 5.50

152
4"x4" MEPILEX FOAM DRESSING  - # 294199 - If quoting 
equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 159771 23.58 5/bx 330.11 14bx/ca

no bid
MSC1244EP 3.92 32.43 301.46

153

6"x6" MEPILEX BORDER FOAM DRESSING  - # 295400 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 474551 38.07 5/bx 380.68 10bx/ca

no bid
MSCEX66EP 4.00 38.00 375

154
4"x4" MEPILEX BORDER FOAM DRESSING  - # 295300 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 111455 22.44 5/bx 224.40 10bx/ca

no bid
MSC2044EP 3.33 32.67 320.24

155
3"x3" MEPILEX BORDER FOAM DRESSING - # 295200 - If 
quoting equal item,  Sample & Specification REQUIRED 599720 16.48 5/bx 230.68 14bx/ca

no bid
MSC2133EP 2.50 24.48 239.94

156

4"x4" MEPILEX BORDER AG ABORBENT ANTIMICROBIAL 
BORDER FOAM DRESSING - # 395390 - If quoting equal 
item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 178474 70.00 5/bx 700.00 10bx/ca

no bid

MSC9744EP 7.13 69.85 684.82

157

6"x6" MEPILEX BORDER AG ABORBENT ANTIMICROBIAL 
BORDER FOAM DRESSING - # 395490 - If quoting equal 
item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 176204 29.86

no bid

MSC9666EP 15.61 156.02 1560.23

158

7.2"x7.2"  MEPILEX BORDER SACRUM AG ABORBENT 
ANTIMICROBIAL BORDER FOAM DRESSING - # 382090 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 250033 200.28 5/bx 1602.27 8bx/ca

no bid

MSC2077EP 9.47 45.97 450.67

159

9.2"x9.2" MEPILEX BORDER SACRUM AG ABORBENT 
ANTIMICROBIAL BORDER FOAM DRESSING - # 382490 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 198947 298.18 5/bx 1490.91 5bx/ca

no bid

MSC20109EP 13.87 68.00 666.67

160
MEPITAC TAPE 3/4" - # 298300 - If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 104079 13.50 162.00 12/ca

no bid
MSC1583h 9.47 113.00

161
MEPITAC TAPE 1.5" - # 298400 - If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 104080 11.22 134.68 12/ca

no bid
MMM27701 4.86 54.99 546.18

162

MEPITEL ONE WOUND CONTACT REQUIRED 4 x 7 - # 
289500 - If quoting equal item, Sample & Specification 
REQUIRED 156884 129.89 10/bx909.20 7bx/ca

no bid

MSC1847EP 9.17 82.50 392.32

163
MEPITEL ONE WOUND REQUIRED 6.8 x 10 - # 289700 - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 156886 144.89 5/bx 1159.09 8bx/ca

no bid
MSC18812EP 24.32 106.63 520

164
MESALT - IMPREGNATED ABSORBENT DRESSING - 4"x4" 
(2x2 fold) 472977 31.57 30/bx 252.57 8bx/ca

no bid
MSC8405 57.50 310.45

165 MOLDABLE DRAINABLE POUCH, 1 1/8" 1 1/2" 220070 46.33 10/ca
no bid

SQU413510 49.81

166 MULTIFOLD TOWEL (PACKAGED) 547588 28.95 2400/ca
EFA-
451801 58.14 200 NON26813 22.49

167 NAIL NIPPERS 254500 1.71 6/bx
no bid

MEC37226 1.13 7.1

168 NEPHROSTOMY DRAIN BAG, 600 ML 134757 205.56 25/ca
no bid

SUBMDD600 25.25 URTC600 19.50

https://www.medline.com/sku/item/MDPMEC37226?skuIndex=P1S3&question=nail+clipper&flowType=search&indexCount=1#


169 NO STING SKIN PREP SPRAY 168268 8.35
no bid

MSC1528 9.00 86.00 1504 10.50

170 NORMAL SALINE .9% 15 ML 472779 29.10 144/ca
no bid

HUD200069 0.21 10.39 31.15

171 NORMAL 0.9% SALINE 100ML 302450 22.64 48/ca
no bid

RDI30296 1.24 23.33 1012-100 28.00  48/cs

172 NORMAL 0.9% SALINE 500ML 251668 24.99 18/ca
no bid

DYND500MLS 2.42 30.50 1012-500 35.00  18/cs

173 NORMLGEL 0.17 oz - PROVIDE SAMPLE NB NB NB NB

no bid

MSC6102 4.03 59.20

174 NUGAUZE PLAIN .25 x 5 YDS STERILE 252269 26.32 12/ca
no bid

NON255145 1.50 18.00 3401
3.00 per 
5yd B&L

175 NUGAUZE PLAIN .50 x 5 YDS STERILE 188933 26.78 12/ca
no bid

NON265125 1.50 18.00 3402
3.00 per 
5yd B&L

176 NUGUAZE IODOFORM 5% .25 x 5 YDS 250784 29.41 12/ca
no bid

NON256145 1.75 20.00 3411
3.00 per 
5yd B&L

177 NUGUAZE IODOFORM 5% .50 x 5 YDS 749926 31.74 12/ca
no bid

NON256125 1.75 20.00 3412
3.00 per 
5yd B&L

178
OIL EMULSION 5x9 NON-ADHESIVE ADAPTIC - PROVIDE 
SAMPLE 474783 25.54 12/bx 155.71 6bx/ca

no bid
KDL6116 125.41

179
ONE PIECE OSTOMY TRANSPARENT CUT TO FIT 3/8" to 
3" 217995 35.57 10/bx

no bid
COI10481 37.61

180
ONE PIECE UROSTOMY TRANSPARENT CUT TO FIT 3/8" 
to 3" WITH VELCRO CLOSE 724843 26.36 10/bx

no bid
COI10494 28.00

181 Opticell Ribbon 18" non-stitched 255488 4.53
no bid

MSC9818R 11.89 57.66 521.76

182 OSTOMY POUCH CLIPS 310448 32.26 20/bx
no bid

HTP8770 40.36

183
OSTOMY POUCH 2 1/4", DRAINABLE - Convatec - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 592634 25.27 10/bx

no bid
HTP8813 31.32

184 Ostomy Pouch, 2 1/4 - Lock & Roll w/ filter (Hollister) 307962 27.53 10/bx
no bid

HTP89111 54.73

185 Ostomy 2 1/4 wafer w/collar (Hollister) 739201 26.42 5/bx
no bid

do not bid

186 Ostomy 2 3/4 drainable pouch Lock & Roll w/ filter (Hollister) 758441 27.53 108/bx
no bid

do not bid

187 Ostomy 2 3/4 wafer w/Collar (Hollister) 740704 26.42 5/bx
no bid

do not bid

188 Ostomy 1 3/4 drainable pouch Lock & Roll w/ filter (Hollister) 767442 27.53 10/bx
no bid

do not bid

189 Ostomy 1 3/4 wafer w/Collar (Hollister) 738922 26.42 5/bx
no bid

do not bid

190 OSTOMY POUCH - CONVEX SOFT - Coloplast 763120 42.24 5/bx
no bid

do not bid

191 OSTOMY SCISSORS - PROVIDE SAMPLE 742309 107.39 30/bx
no bid

COI95050 129.33

192
PENIS POUCH (1 size fits all) - Hollister - If quoting equal 
item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 665380 56.05 10/bx

no bid
HTP9873 70.76

193 PEROXIDE 4 OZ 594153 0.29 6.97 24/ca
EFA-
410008 0.88 1 MDS098014 9.60

194 PERSONAL PROTECTION KIT 122114 5.66 135.93 24/ca
EIC-
620099 3.20 1 do not bid

195

PHYTOPLEX BOTAINICAL NUTRITION FOR SENSITIVE 
SKIN, HYDRAGUARD SILICONE CREAM - Medline Remedy - 
2 OZ NB NB NB NB

no bid

MSC092532 4.42 74.54 MSC092532 58.00  24/cs

196
PHYTOPLEX BOTAINICAL NUTRITION FOR SENSITIVE 
SKIN, 4-in1 BARRIER CREAM CLOTH - Medline Remedy NB NB NB NB

no bid
MSC092507 4.58 82.39 MSC092508 75.00  32/cs

197 PICC LINE DRESSING CHANGE TRAY 171970 4.83 193.20 40/ca
no bid

DYND75223 124.40

198 PISTON IRRIGATION TRAYS 185375 0.90 18.00 20/ca
no bid

DYND20302 19.31 AS136 18.00  20/cs

199 Pleurx Drainage Kit with 1000ml vacuum bottle 192595 481.19 10/ca
no bid

BXT507510 949.22 50-7510 480.00  10/cs

200 PREP PADS POVIDINE IODINE PADS 749503 3.39 100/bx 33.86 10/ca
EFA-4160

3.58 100 MDS093917 26.00

201
PROFESSIONAL TOWEL, 2 PLY TISSUE/POLY, 13" x 18", 
WHITE 196154 18.61 500/ca

EFA-5398
0.05 1 NON24356W 15.00

202
PURACOL PLUS MICROSCAFFOLD COLLAGEN WOULD 
DRESSING - 4.2" x 4.5" 741496 1355.95 50/bx

no bid
MSC8644EP 19.93 189.83 814.17 MSC8644EP 740.00  50/cs

203
PURACOL PLUS AG MICROSCAFFOLD COLLAGEN 
WOULD DRESSING - 4.2" x 4.5" 146691 1688.75 50/bx

no bid
MSC8744EP 31.24 263.09 1156.24 MSC8744EP 1150.00  50/cs

204 REP BANDS - 50 YDS - LEVEL 1 (PEACH) 100411 77.956
EIC-3549

2.45 1 MDSPH019 18.00 145.1

205 REP BANDS - 50 YDS - LEVEL 3 (GREEN) 100414 80.93
no bid

MDSPH021 28.00 305.49

206 REP BANDS - 50 YDS - LEVEL 5 (PLUM) NB NB NB NB
no bid

MDSPH023 43.00 141.8

207 SAFETY LOK 10 ML 21G 1 1/2 143343 29.68 50/bx
no bid

B-D309643 0.70 34.06 135.05

208 SANI-CLOTH PLUS WIPES, LARGE, 6" x 6 3/4" 528786 63.27 12/ca
EDI-
340718 9.65 1 MSC351300 5.86 63.24

209

SANI-HANDS INSTANT SANITIZING HAND WIPES - PDI 
P13472 - If quoting equal item, Sample & Specification 
REQUIRED 135958 55.86 12/ca

EIC-
410403

5.60 1 HH70W160 6.40 33.42 D413472 85.00  1620/cs

210 SHARPS CONTAINER 1L 155559 1.13 81.43 72/ca
EIC-4108

4.89 1 MDS705110 1.00 97.00

211 SHARPS CONTAINER 2.2 QUART 762849 2.46 147.76 60/ca
EIC-
351710 1.40 1 do not bid
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212 SHARPS CONTAINER 2 GAL TYCO 309145 3.39 67.94 20/ca
EIC-3549

2.45 1 do not bid MDS705202 74.00  20/cs

213 SHILEY TRACH INNER CANNULA (SIZE 7) 109814 6.73 67.94 20/ca
EIC-
351901 3.15 1 MLK7SCT 97.13 70XLTIN721 65.00  10/bx

214 SHILEY TRACH INNER CANNULA (SIZE 8) 112179 6.73 67.94 20/ca
no bid

MLK8DIC 36.99 80XLTIN 65.00  10/bx

215 SHILEY TRACH TUBE EXTENDED CUFF (SIZE8) 112189 83.47
no bid

MLK80XLTCD 97.13 80XTUX 81.00

216 SHILEY CANNULA XLT - PROVIDE SAMPLE 130028 65.02 10/bx
no bid

do not bid

217

SHILEY TRACH SOFT EXTENDED CUFF TUBE - # 
70XLTCP - If quoting equal item, Sample & Specification 
REQUIRED 112186 80.63

no bid

MLK70XLTCP 41.76 70XLTCP 81.00

218

SINGLE USE SAFETY LANCET - Unistik 3 Comfort - Owen 
Mumford # AT1044 - If quoting equal, Sample & 
Specifications REQUIRED 151535 23.86 200/bx

EDI-3276-
NG

8.25

100 MPHPRESS28 8.02 200.01

219 SILVER NITRATE APPLICATOR 499277 19.39 100/vl
no bid

TEE7482 225.25

220 NO STING SKIN PREP BARRIER WIPES 181353 6.82 50/bx
duplicate

MSC1505 29.47 262.70 1503 110.00  1000/cs

221 SMITH & NEPHEW SKIN PREP PADS, BOX 709993 8.75 50/bx
EFA-4166

19.62 50 MSC1505 29.47 262.70 1506 64.00  1000/cs

222 SPECIMEN CONTAINER 4 OZ W/SCREW ON LID, STERILE 511659 49.49 10/ca
no bid

DYND30331 0.71 23.64

223 Spectra 360 Electrode Gel Salt Free Hypoallergenic 8.5 oz 079327 2.15 25.81 12/bx 154.87 72/ca
EDI-3129

3.11 1 do not bid

224 SKIN STAPLE REMOVER 185384 0.75 37.65 50/ca
no bid

DYNJ04058 0.82 61.62 4522 38.00  50/cs

225 STERI STRIP 1/4" x 3" SKIN CLOSURES 938555 40.10 50/bx
EFA-
109903 33.72 50 NON250314 3522 26.00  300/bx

226 STERILE COTTON TIPPED APPLICATOR 6" x 1/12" 137914 25.22 1000/ca
EFA-4411

2.23 100 MDS202000 6.15 51.00

227 STERILE FOAM TIPPED WOUND MEASURING DEVICE 389700 28.83 50/bx
no bid

MSC1234H 6.50

228 STERILE GAUZE SPONGES 4" x 4" - 8 PLY 752230 1.61 200/pk  32.10 20/ca
EFA-1034

1.11 25 PRM21408C 75.60 JML4800 24.50  1200/cs

229 STERILE GLOVES LARGE 927889 33.06 50/bx 132.24 4bx/ca
EGL-
539003 35.25 50 MDS198416 1.00 74.18

230 STERILE GLOVES MEDIUM 927871 33.06 50/bx 132.24 4bx/ca
EGL-
539002 35.25 50 MDS198415 1.00 74.18

231 STERILE GLOVES SMALL 927814 33.06 50/bx 132.24 4bx/ca
EGL-
539001 35.25 50 MDS198414 1.00 74.18

232 STERILE SPONGES 2" x 2" - 8 PLY 752233 1.02 50x2/bx30.59 1500x2/c
EFA-1030

1.11 50 PRM21208C 34.20 JML2800 28.00  5000/cs

233 STERILE SURGICAL LUBRICANT 175420 5.86 144/bx
EFA-
417310 4.99 144 MDS88000T2 18.96 74.96

234 STERILE TONGUE DEPRESSORS 752038 3.03 500/bx
EFA-4418

2.66 100 MDS202073 5.00 37.00

235 STERILE WATER 100ml 302451 21.32 48/ca
no bid

RDI30295 1.30 24.50

236 STETHESCOPES 254398 2.73
EDI-7350-
bk 2.28 1 MDS926101 2.00

237 STICK, ORANGE 4 1/2" NB NB NB NB
no bid

NON801780 4.38

238 STOMAHESIVE PASTE 2 OZ 251515 7.31
no bid

SQU183910CS 45.07 183910 8.00

239 STOMAHESIVE POWDER 292854 6.47
no bid

SQU025510 2.98 25510 6.50

240 SUPER FLUFF 6" x 6.75" STERILE 112109 107.95 480/ca
no bid

NON25852 27.68

241 SUR FIT NATURA CONVEX INSERTS 1-1/4" 483677 8.66 5/bx
no bid

SQU404010 27.68 404010 10.00  5/bx

242
SUR FIT NATURA STOMAHESIVE FLEXIBLE CUT TO FIT 
SKIN BARRIER 1.75" WAFER - WHITE 806273 44.28 10/bx

no bid
SQU125264 27.80 125259 40.00  10/bx

243 SUR-FIT 1.75" DRAINABLE POUCH 12" OPAQUE 928051 56.40 20/bx
no bid

SQU401507 146.69 401502 28.00  10/bx

244 SUR FIT NATURA UROSTOMY POUCH W/1.75" FLANGE 806604 24.60 10/bx
no bid

SQU401512 16.50 401544 34.00  10/bx

245
SUR FIT NATURA STOMAHESIVE FLEXIBLE CUT TO FIT 
SKIN BARRIER 2.25" WAFER - TAN 154961 44.28 10/bx

no bid
SQU125265 16.50 125265 40.00  10/bx

246 SUR FIT NATURA 2.25" - 10" OPAQUE POUCH 806471 23.76 10/bx
no bid

SQU401508 17.30 401508 28.00  10/bx

247 SUR FIT UROSTOMY 2.25" POUCH 708379 31.54 10/bx
no bid

SQU401536 16.03 401545 34.00  10/bx

248
SUR FIT NATURA STOMAHESIVE FLEXIBLE CUT TO FIT 
SKIN BARRIER 2.75" WAFER 806349 44.28 10/bx

no bid
SQU125266 25.70 125266 40.00  10/bx

249 12" SUR FIT STANDARD POUCH 2.75" FLANGE 708343 23.76 10/bx
no bid

SQU401504 4.11 401514 28.00  10/bx

250 SUTURE REMOVER KIT 308728 1.85 92.23 50/bx
EMI-9232

1.38 1 4521 28.00  50/cs

251 SYRINGE 2 OZ CATHETER TIP 185373 17.65 50/ca
EFA-5401

0.65 1

252 SYRINGE LUER LOCK 10 ML 750658 6.09 100/bx
EDI-
340005 6.98 100 B-D381512

253 SYRINGE LUER LOCK 20 ML 750661 8.47 50/bx
EDI-
340130 13.60 40 B-D302830 65.63

254 SYRINGE LUER LOCK 30 ML 750664 9.53 50/bx
EDI-
340011 11.17 50 B-D302832 87.50
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255 SYRINGE SAFETY LOK 3 ML 25G 5/8 167435 10.85 100/bx
EDI-
340530 10.91 100 B-D309592 213.50

256 STRINGE 60CC W/2 0Z CATH TIP 483438 35.06 40/bx
EDI-
340137 14.27 30 DYND20325 516.19

257 TAPE TRANSPORE 1" 660605 5.28 12/bx
EFA-
115401 3.85 12 NON270201 68.22 3572 8.00  12/bx

258 TAPE TRANSPORE 2" 660613 5.29 6/bx
EFA-
115402 3.85 6 NON270202 71.09 3573 8.00  6/bx

259 TAPE MICROPORE PAPER 1" 198845 3.43 12/bx
EFA-
115801 3.15 12 NON270001 48.24

260 TAPE, MICROPORE 2" x 10 YD PAPER 198844 3.43 6/bx
EFA-
115802 3.15 6 NON270002 48.24

261 TB SYRINGE 1ML 27 G x 1/2 894147 12.50 100/bx
EDI-
340522 12.79 100 SYR101272 83.17

262 TEGADERM 2 3/8" x 2 3/4" 750049 21.44 100/bx
EFA-3524

18.98 100 MSC2302 40.00 3M1624W 30.00  100/bx

263 TEGADERM 4" x 4 3/4" TRANSPARENT DRESSING 181405 22.50 50/bx
EFA-3525

24.87 50 MSC2304 40.91 3M1626W 30.00  50/bx

264 TELFA 2" x 3" PADS 749980 1.15 57.65 50/ca
EFA-1046

4.36 100 NON25700A 72.39

265 TELFA 3" x 4" PADS 111908 5.10 100/bx
EFA-1047

6.33 100 NON25710 57.35

266 THERAPUTTY, HAND GRIP, GREEN, 4 OZ., MEDIUM NB NB NB NB
no bid

MDSP100907 4.85

267 THERAPUTTY, HAND GRIP, RED, 4 OZ, SOFT NB NB NB NB
no bid

MDSP100906 4.85

268 TIE ON FACE MASK 787123 32.74 300/ca
EIC-
155403 15.75 100 NON27377 27.32

269 TRACHEOSTOMY TUBE HOLDERS 118216 2.82
EAW-
236315 2.03 1 BAK241 33.14 DALE240 38.00  10/bx

270
TRACH CARE TRAYS - # AS860 - If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 404004 16.21 20/ca

no bid
Do not bid

271 TRIAD HYROPHILLAC WOUND DRESSING, 6OZ 126742 18.78 225.32 12/ca
no bid

COI1967CS COL1967 280.00  12/cs

272 TUBE/CATHETER CLAMP 137771 31.54 100/bx
no bid

273
TUBIFAST SMALL LIMB - # 2434 - If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 849463 9.57

no bid
MSC9500 19.91

274
TUBIFAST SMALL - MEDIUM LIMB - # 2436 - If quoting 
equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 849471 10.36

no bid
MSC9501 22.86

275
TUBIFAST LARGE LIMB - # 2438 - If quoting equal item, 
Sample & Specification REQUIRED 849489 13.19

no bid
MSC9503 25.22

276

TUBIFAST X-LARGE LIMBS, HEADS, CHILDRENS TRUNK - 
# 2440 - If quoting equal item, Sample & Specification 
REQUIRED 849505 18.16

no bid

MSC9506 37.69

277
TUBIFAST LARGE ADULT TRUNKS - # 2444 - If quoting 
equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 139330 39.09

no bid
MSC9508 53.00

278 URETHRAL CATH TRAY W/14FR 179884 30.59 20/ca
no bid

DYNC1816 34.98 AMS-AS870 28.00  20/cs

279
URETHRAL CATH INSERTION TRAY (WITHOUT 
CATHETER) 224626 61.41 20/ca

no bid
DYND10305 28.45

280 Urostomy pouch cut-to-fit 3/8"-1 3/4" (Coloplast #10586) 220523 46.59 10/bx
no bid

COI10586 54.20

281 COLOPLAST URINARY DRAIN BAG, 2000ML 172420 1.24 24.71 20/ca
no bid

DYND15207 46.58

282
VACUTAINER BLOOD COLLECTION SET SAFETY-LOK 
WINGED W/LUERS 21 GA x 3/4", 12" 616890 19.68 50/bx

EDI-
301101 12.80 50 B-D368652 330.64

283
VACUTAINER BLOOD COLLECTION SET SAFETY-LOK 
WINGED W/LUERS 23 GA x 3/4", 12" 616893 19.68 50/bx

EDI-
301301 12.80 50 B-D368653 330.64 BD367283 68.00  50/bx

284 VACUTAINER FEMALE LUER ADAPTER 172346 139.05 200/ca
no bid

do not bid

285 VACUTAINER MALE LUER ADAPTER 156989 33.86 100/bx
no bid

do not bid

286 VACUTAINER HOLDER PEDIATRIC 125135 51.99 50/bx
no bid

do not bid

287 VACUTAINER HOLDER REG 723163 14.21 250/bag
EDI-3096

9.28 100 do not bid

288 VANISHPOINT SYRINGE - 20G X 1" - 10CC 172404 71.77 100/bx
EDI-
340718 9.66 100 RTI11071 300.35 11071 260.00  600/cs

289 VANISHPOINT SYRINGE - 25G x 5/8" 611160 34.50 100/bx
EDI-
340530 10.78 100 do not bid 82091 125.00  400/cs

290 VANISHPOINT SYRINGE - 25G x 1" 611178 34.50 100/bx
EDI-
340531 12.29 100 RTI10391 227.29 82011 125.00  400/cs

291
VIONEX 4 OZ ANTIMICROBIAL LIQUID SOAP W/FLIP TOP - 
PROVIDE SAMPLE 148786 3.82 91.57 24/ca

no bid
HHABSP04 17.62

292 VIONEX NO RINSE ANTISEPTIC GEL 4 OZ W/FLIP TOP 777007 3.79 91.03 24/ca
EIC-6405

4.28 1 HH70G04 20.79

293 WASHBASIN, RECTANGULAR, GRAPHITE, 8 QT 195093 41.98 50/ca
EFA-4508

0.68 1 DYND80342 26.36

294 WIRELESS WIPES - ANTIBACTERIAL 709609 69.55 48/ca
no bid

END259000 6.81

295 XEROFORM PETROLATUM GAUZE, 2" x 2", STERILE 596270 18.96 25/bx
no bid

CUR253220 66.69

296 XEROFORM PETROLATUM GAUZE, 5" x 9", STERILE 503870 26.86 25/bx
no bid

CUR253590 129.42 3654 28.00  50/bx

297

PERSONAL DOUBLE ADVANCED PUMP W/O BATTERY - 
Medela # 57018W - If quoting equal item, Sample & 
Specification REQUIRED NB NB NB NB

no bid

do not bid



298

SYMPHONY DOUBLE  PUMPING KIT - Medela # 67099W - If 
quoting equal item, Sample & Specification REQUIRED 162131 180.89 6/ca

no bid
do not bid

MINIMUM ORDER 25.00 min order
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